
Terms and Conditions (Effective Date: January 1, 2018) 
 
Thank you for visiting DrPausins.com (the “Site”) managed by Achlis Laboratories (the “Company”). By using the Site you agree 
to be bound by the terms set forth herein (“Terms and Conditions”). By registering for, logging into, visiting and/or otherwise 
using the Site in any way, you indicate that you understand and intend these Terms and Conditions to be the legal equivalent of 
a signed, written contract and equally binding, and that you accept the terms of use as set forth in these Terms and Conditions 
and agree to be legally bound by them. If you do not accept all of the terms of use set forth in these Terms and Conditions, 
please do not use the Site. The Company may change these Terms and Conditions at any time. The modified Terms and 
Conditions will be effective immediately upon posting and you agree to the new posted Terms and Conditions by continuing 
your use of the Site. You are responsible for staying informed of any changes. If you do not agree with the Terms and 
Conditions, your only remedy is to stop using the Site. If you have questions or comments about a Company product, you may 
call 1-202-818-0248. If you have other questions or comments about this Site, you may contact us at services@achlislabs.com. 
 
Terms of Use 
This Site (including the website software and files) and content provided on this Site, including the code, text, graphics, images, 
photographs, analyses, studies, reports, and downloads (all such content collectively, the “Content”) are the exclusive property 
of Company or are licensed to Company, and are protected by law, including United States copyright and trademark law, as 
well as other state, national, and international laws and regulations. Except as expressly provided in these Terms and 
Conditions, Company does not grant any express or implied rights to you. The contents of this Site are copyrighted. Company 
also owns copyright rights in the Site as a collective work and/or compilation, and in any and all databases accessible on or 
through the Site. Unless otherwise noted, Company, Dr. Pausin’s®, and other brands featured on the Site constitute our 
trade/service marks. You agree not to directly or indirectly: attempt to register, challenge or contest the validity or Company’s 
ownership of, such copyrights, trademarks or any other Company intellectual property, or assist any third party in doing so. The 
Site may also include the product, service and company names, as well as logos, of third parties. Such third-party designations 
are the trade/service marks of their respective owners, and may not be used without the prior written permission of their 
respective owners. 
 
In consideration of your use of the Site, you agree to provide true, accurate, current, and complete information about yourself if 
you create an account with Company or any vendor performing services related to this Site (“Account Information”). If you 
provide any information that is untrue, inaccurate, not current, or incomplete, or Company has reasonable grounds to suspect 
that such information is untrue, inaccurate, not current, or incomplete, Company may suspend or terminate your account 
and/or refuse any and all current and future use of the Site. Account information and certain other information about you is 
subject to our Privacy Policy when it is in our possession and may additionally be subject to a third party’s Privacy Policy as 
described more fully in our Privacy Policy. You may choose to create an account to access certain parts of the Site. You will 
receive a password and account designation when you have completed the Account Information. You are responsible for 
maintaining the confidentiality of the password and account and are fully responsible for all activities that occur under your 
account. You agree to be responsible for any losses incurred by Company, a Company affiliate, or another party due to 
someone else using your account and/or password either with or without your knowledge. You agree to immediately notify us 
of any unauthorized use of your password or account or any other breach of security. To the extent permitted by law, products 
available through the Site are offered for individual use only and are not offered for commercial use or resale purposes. 
 
Grant of License 
Company grants you a personal, revocable, nonexclusive, nontransferable license to use this Site conditioned on your 
continued compliance with these Terms and Conditions. Limited portions of the Content available in the public areas of the Site 
may be accessed, printed and downloaded on an occasional basis for personal and non-commercial purposes; provided that all 
hard copies contain all copyright and other applicable proprietary rights notices included in such content and information 
and/or appropriate attribution to Company in a form and manner acceptable to Company. You may not use Content in any 
manner that suggests the endorsement or association of any third-party entity, person, product or service by Company unless 
express written permission has been given by Company in advance. You may not under any circumstances copy, print or 
download in any medium all or substantially all of the Content. You agree not to reproduce, duplicate, copy, sell, resell, use, 
access or exploit the Site or any information from the Site for any commercial purpose. You agree not to access the Site by any 
means other than through the interface that is provided by Company for use in accessing the Site. You may not remove 
copyright notices or other notices of intellectual property rights from the Site or any content available on or through the Site. 
Any unauthorized use of this Site or the Content will terminate the permission granted by these Terms and Conditions and may 
violate applicable laws and regulations, including copyright and trademark laws. 
 
Company’s Rights 
Company may terminate your access, or suspend your access to all or part of the Site, without notice, for any conduct that 
Company, in its sole discretion, believes is in violation of any applicable law or is harmful to the interests of Company or any 
third-party service provider. Company makes reasonable efforts to provide accurate information about prices on the Site. 
Nevertheless, pricing errors may appear on the Site. Accordingly, Company does not guarantee the prices set forth on the Site 
Prices on the Site are subject to change without notice. 


